ltem: Water gmﬁm_.m. Parts & Accessories Department: Water Distribution

Date: 8/5/11 Buyer: Phil CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

Bid # PC-093-11 File #19

Vendors
Description
of AD Supply Neptune Technology | Water Products, Inc Badger Meter, Inc
Item Waterworks “ . :
Displacement Meters Unit Cost / Extension Unit Cost / Extension No Bid No Bid
5/8" — 200 each $98.00/$19,600.00 | $158.00/$31,600.00
17 — 500 each $143.50/$71,750.00 1 $208.00/$104,000.00
1-1/2” — 25 each $359.50/ $8,987.50 $335.00/$8,375.00
27 — 25 each $505.00/$12,625.00 | $430.00/%10,750.00
Turbine Type
2" -2 each $710.00 / $1,420.00 $600.00 / $1,200.00
3"~ 4 each $885.00/ $3,540.00 | $800.00/$3,200.00
4" —each $1,723.50/ $6,894.00 § $1,010.10/ $4,040.40
6” — 1 each $3,105.00 / $3,105.00 § $1,790.00/ $1,790.00
8" — 1 each $5,267.00/ $5,267.00 | $2,790.00/$2,790.00
10" — 1 each $6,867.00/$6,867.00 | $4,340.00 / $4,340.00




Description

HD Supply
Waterworks Neptune Technology | Water Products, Inc Of
item

Compound Meters Unit Cost / Extension
2" —1 each No Bid $1,083.85/ $1,083.85
3" —4 each $1,279.00/ $5,116.00 | $1,480.00/ $5,920.00
4’ — 4 each $2,222.00/$8,888.00 § $2,080.00/$8,320.00
6" — 1 each $3,838.00/$3,838.00 § $4,227.75/%4,227.75

Fire Service Turbine |
4” — 1 each $5,286.00/ $5,286.00 | $2,631.00/$2,631.00
6” — 1 each $7,035.00/$7,035.00 | $3,440.00/ $3,440.00
8" -1 each $11,550.00/$11,550.00 § $4,391.00/ $4,391.00

Fire Service Turbine — Protectus Type

4" — 1 each $5,286.00/ $5,286.00 § $4,980.00/ $4,980.00
8"~ 1 each $7,035.00/$7,035.00 § $5,836.75/$5,836.75
8" — 1 each $11,550.00/$11,550.00 § $8,315.00/$8,315.00

Fire Hydrant Meters
3"~ 5each $835.00 / $4,175.00 $780.00/$3,900.00




Description

HD Supply
Neptune Technology § Water Products, Inc Of
Waterworks
Item
Unit Cost / Extension Unit Cost / Extension
Wall Mount MIU — Single Meter ~ 20 each No Bid $90.00/ $1,800.00
Wall Mount MIU ~ Multiple Meters — 30 ea No Bid $90.00 / $2,700.00
Pit Mount MIU - Single Meter 500 each No Bid $90.00 / $45,000.00
Pit Mount MIU — Multiple Meters — 200 each No Bid $90.00 /7 $18,000.00
Pit Receptacle — Touch Pads — 50 each $13.95 1 $697 .50 $10.80/ $540.00




