
Diamond International Peterbilt of Joplin Shawnee Mission #1

2-Ton Truck Unit Price 61,241.00$ 67,950.00$ 51,121.00$

Truck Make International Peterbilt Ford

Model / Year 4300 M7 / 2010 325 / 2010 F-550 XL DRW / 2010

GVWR (19,000#) 19,500# 19,500# 19,500

Engine (6.4L turbo diesel) 6.4 Liter 6.7 Liter 6.4Liter Diesel

CtoA/WB/OTW (84/150/94) 84.9 / 152 / 94 84.2 / 154 / 98 84 / 165 / 93.9

Cab & Chassis Warranty 24 months / unlimited 3 years / 36,000 miles

Cab & Power Train 24 months / unlimited 5 years / 60,000 miles

Bed Make Jensen Jensen Knapheide

Model Rugged Service Rugged Service PUMXT-123C Platform

Hoist Make Reading Rugby Knapheide

Model TRB-813 HR-540 KH-15125F-E

Plow Make Boss Boss Western

Model Power V 9' 2" Power V 10' UJMVPP85

Plow Control Make Boss Boss Western

Model Hand held Hand held Cab Command

Days to Delivery 60 - 90 90 - 120

Exceptions None listed Crane is Stellar EC2K Cut off date is 11/27/09
Trailering is 16,000#

max.

Utility Bed Truck Unit Price 35,656.00$

Truck Make NO BID NO BID Ford

Model / Year F350 4x2 SRW / 2010

Body Make Knapheide

Model 696 D38F-J

Hoist Make / Model As specified

Warranty 6 years

Days to Delivery 90 - 120

Exceptions

Cut off date is 11/27/09

Trucks with Flat and Utility Beds for WPC
Bid #PC-091-09, File #269, Bid Date: Thursday, September 17, 2009

Vendors
Description of Item

Spare & jack option =
$245.00
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Trucks with Flat and Utility Beds for WPC
Bid #PC-091-09, File #269, Bid Date: Thursday, September 17, 2009

Shawnee Mission #2 Shawnee Mission #3 KC Freightliner #1

2-Ton Truck Unit Price 48,648.00$ 50,095.00$ 65,799.00$

Truck Make Ford Ford Freightliner

Model / Year F-550 XL DRW / 2010 F-550 XL DRW / 2010 M2-106 / 2010

GVWR (19,000#) 19,500# 19,500# 20,940#

Engine (6.4L turbo diesel) 6.4Liter Diesel 6.4Liter Diesel 6.7 Liter

CtoA/WB/OTW (84/150/94) 84 / 165 / 93.9 84 / 165 / 93.9 92 / 158 / 94

Cab & Chassis Warranty 3 years / 36,000 miles 3 years / 36,000 miles 3 years / 100,000 miles

Cab & Power Train 5 years / 60,000 miles 5 years / 60,000 miles

Bed Make Jensen Omaha Standard Jensen

Model Rugged Service 12.6 HD 12' x 98" Rugged Service

Hoist Make Reading Omaha Standard Reading

Model RJB-813 L115SF-11 RTB-813

Plow Make Boss Meyer Boss

Model Power V 9' 2" Super V 9.5 Power V

Plow Control Make Boss Meyer Boss

Model Hand Held V-68 Hand Held

Days to Delivery 90 - 120 90 - 120 120

Exceptions Cut off date is 11/27/09 Cut off date is 11/27/09 None listed
Trailering is 16,000#

max.
Trailering is 16,000#

max.

Utility Bed Truck Unit Price 34,390.00$ 34,938.00$

Truck Make Ford Ford NO BID

Model / Year F-350 XL SRW / 2010 F-350 XL SRW / 2010

Body Make Reading Omaha Standard

Model USLP98AHH SB-96VT

Hoist Make / Model As specified As specified

Warranty

Days to Delivery 90 - 120 90 - 120

Exceptions

Cut off date is 11/27/09 Cut off date is 11/27/09

Spare & Jack option =
$245.00

Spare & jack option =
$245.00

Description of Item
Vendors
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Trucks with Flat and Utility Beds for WPC
Bid #PC-091-09, File #269, Bid Date: Thursday, September 17, 2009

KC Freightliner #2 Olathe Ford #1 Olathe Ford #2

2-Ton Truck Unit Price $ 67,782.00 51,169.00$ 52,187.00$

Truck Make Freightliner Ford Ford

Model / Year M2-106 / 2010 F-550 / 2010 F-550 / 2010

GVWR (19,000#) 20,940# 19,500# 19,500#

Engine (6.4L turbo diesel) 6.7 Liter 6.4 Liter Diesel 6.4 Liter Diesel

CtoA/WB/OTW (84/150/94) 92 / 158 / 94 84 / 165 / 94 84 / 165 / 94

Cab & Chassis Warranty 24 months / unlimited

Cab & Power Train

Bed Make Knapheide Omaha Standard Knapheide

Model PVMXT-123C Platform 12.6 HD PVMXT-123C

Hoist Make Knapheide Omaha Standard Knapheide

Model KH-1512SF-E 415SF-11 KH-1512SF-E

Plow Make Western Meyer Western

Model UTMVPP85 Super V 9.5 UTMVPP85

Plow Control Make Western Meyer Western

Model Cab Command V-68 Cab Command

Days to Delivery 120 70 - 90 Not listed

Exceptions None listed
Trailering is 10,000#

max.
None listed

Utility Bed Truck Unit Price $ 35,874.00 $ 36,592.00

Truck Make NO BID Ford Ford

Model / Year F-350 / 2010 F-350 / 2010

Body Make Omaha Standard Knapheide

Model SB-96VT 696D38F-J

Hoist Make / Model Venturo CT2003FB Venturo CT2003FB

Warranty

Days to Delivery 70 - 90 70 - 90

Exceptions Class 4 2" ball hitch None listed

Vendors
Description of Item
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Trucks with Flat and Utility Beds for WPC
Bid #PC-091-09, File #269, Bid Date: Thursday, September 17, 2009

Midway Ford Truck Laird Noller Ford #1 Laird Noller Ford #2

2-Ton Truck Unit Price $ 49,861.00 51,953.00$

Truck Make Ford Ford NO BID

Model / Year F-550 / 2010 F-550 / 2010

GVWR (19,000#) 19,500# 19,500#

Engine (6.4L turbo diesel) 6.4 Liter Diesel 6.4 Liter Diesel

CtoA/WB/OTW (84/150/94) 84 / 165 / 93.6 84 / 165 / 93.9

Cab & Chassis Warranty Not listed

Cab & Power Train

Bed Make Omaha Standard Knapheide

Model 12.6 HD PVMXT-123C

Hoist Make Omaha Standard Knapheide

Model 415SF-11 KH-1512SF-E

Plow Make Meyer Western

Model Super V 9.5 UTMVPP85

Plow Control Make Meyer Western

Model V-68 Cab Command

Days to Delivery Not listed 90 - 120 ARO

Exceptions 12,000# payload max.

Utility Bed Truck Unit Price 35,286.00$ $ 36,806.00 $ 39,732.00

Truck Make Ford Ford Ford

Model / Year F-350 / 2010 F-350 / 2010 F-350

Body Make Omaha Standard Knapheide Stahl

Model Service 696D38F-J CST98VVDLT-365

Hoist Make / Model Venturo CT2003FB Venturo CT2003FB Stellar EC2K

Warranty

Days to Delivery Not listed 90 - 120 ARO 90 - 120 ARO

Exceptions None listed None listed Not listed

Class 4 10,000# max
hitch

Description of Item
Vendors
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Trucks with Flat and Utility Beds for WPC
Bid #PC-091-09, File #269, Bid Date: Thursday, September 17, 2009

Vendors

Laird Noller Ford #3

2-Ton Truck Unit Price $ 51,542.00

Truck Make Ford

Model / Year F-550 / 2010

GVWR (19,000#) 19,500#

Engine (6.4L turbo diesel) 6.4 Liter Diesel

CtoA/WB/OTW (84/150/94) 84 / 165 / 93.9

Cab & Chassis Warranty Not found

Cab & Power Train

Bed Make Omaha Standard

Model 12' 6" - 98" HD

Hoist Make Omaha Standard

Model 415DH

Plow Make Boss

Model Power V

Plow Control Make

Model

Days to Delivery 90 - 120 ARO

Exceptions 12,000# payload max.

Utility Bed Truck Unit Price 37,112.00$

Truck Make Ford

Model / Year F-350 / 2010

Body Make Omaha Standard

Model 96D38VT

Hoist Make / Model AutoCrane Econo Ton II

Warranty 2 years

Days to Delivery 90 - 120 ARO

Exceptions

Description of Item
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